
Description Unit Description Brand Estimated Usage
Agni Enterprises LLC

dba Head to Heels
COPACO/Imperial Dade

Malone Office 

Environments
Sam Tell & Son Inc.

Southeastern Paper 

Group

1

Aluminum Foil, Heavy Duty, 18X500 500 ft roll Crystalware, or approved equal 200

$45.97- per roll $10.24-per roll

Victoria Bay

51807

$45.76 -per roll

Boardwalk 

87 GAGUE

$27.42-per roll

Western Plastics / 

PAFOIL18X5STD

$23.67- per roll

Ocala/Smart

51600242

2

Aluminum, Foil Sheet, 9" x 10-3/4" box Crystalware, or approved equal 125

$15.29

* Price quoted for 

500/box. Sold as 

500/Box, 6 Boxes/Carton

$12.46

Victoria Bay

59100VBB

500 ct

$12.61 

Boardwalk

500 ct

$6.45

Handi Foil

29100  

200 ct

$43.54

Ocala/Smart

51600244

6/500 ct 

3

Aprons, Bib, Disposable, 28X46 10/100 Safety Zone, or approved equal 25

$58.83-per 10bx case $5.40

AmerCare Royal

2846 White

100 ct

$7.21

100 ct

$14.14

Winco / BADP-2846

100 ct

$53.83

AmercareRoyal

97054034

5/100 ct 

4

Bags, Clear, w/ Die Cut Handle 100 ct Clearbags, or approved equal 300

$19.17

* Price quoted for 

100/box. Sold as 

500/case, 

Variance: Size 9" x 12"

$4.80

Clearbags

H912CL120PKCS

100 ct

$17.15

100 ct

$29.73

SamTell REDE / 

8336T6TUL

500 ct

$10.77

Elkay

51805573

6x3x15

1000 ct 

5

Bags, Lunch, Brown #6 500 ct Duro, or approved equal 100

$25.09-per case 500 $12.57

Victoria Bay

VB6SOB

500 ct

$59.45 

Bagcraft

500 ct

$14.79

Duro Bag/PABAG

500 ct

$12.07

Duro Bag

45091308

500 ct

6

Bags, Lunch, Plastic (Subway Style) 1000 ct Elkay Plastic, or approved equal 1000

 $45.93-per case 500

Size: 6" x 3" x 15" 1.5Mil

$10.50

Elkay 6G063015

PB-6315

1000 ct

$43.87

Bagcraf

1200 ct

$15.27

Elkay Plastics

6G063015

1000 ct

$10.77

Elkay

51805573

6x3x15

1000ct 

7

Bags, Lunch, 8 # waxed,  6 x 12 white prefered 1000 ct Bagcraft, or approved equal 75

$112.03-per case 1000 $72.10

Bagcraft 300298

8wax

1000 ct

$19.70

500 ct

$22.98

Duro Bag

PABAG8W

500 ct

$67.27

Bagcraft

51008115

1000 ct

8

Bags, Wax Sandwich, 6"x3/4"x7" 1000 ct Brown, or approved equal 100

$33.50

 Price quoted for 

1000/box. Sold as 

6000/case, 

Variance: Size 6" x 3/4" x 

6 7/8" alternate

$15.70

Fischer Paper Products

508-8

5088B

1000 ct

$48.74 

 2000 ct

$17.62

Elkay Plastics

DP657

2000 ct

$38.59

Bagcraft

51008113

1000 ct

9

Bags, Ziplock, 13X15 (2 gallon) 10/100 ct Elkay Plastic, or approved equal 100

$141.73- per case 100 per 

pack/10 pack case

$15.06

Elkay

F21315

1000 ct

$126.39

Boardwalk

1000 ct

$33.73

SC Johnson

94603

100 ct

$64.59

Elkay

#990043

1000 ct

10

Bags, Ziplock, 4X6 10/100 ct Elkay Plastic, or approved equal 100

$20.66- 1000/Case $9.27

Elkay

F20406

1000 ct

$24.62

1000 ct

$25.52

SC Johnson

94600-ZIPLOCK

500 ct

$9.56

Elkay

#990036

1000 ct

11

Beard Cover restraints white 1000 ct.
Supply Source/Saftey Zone, or approved 

equal
25

$42.48- 1000/Case $17.70

Hospeco

RBP1M

1000 ct

$32.14

Ambitex

1000 ct

$28.64

Sam Tell REDE

EMPRD1000

1000 ct

$5.93

Amercare

97054171

100 ct box

12

Bleach 3/120 fl oz Clorox, or approved equal 500

$35.58

3/121fl oz

$9.90

KIK

Kikbleach

3/120 oz

$12.20

Pure Bright

3/1 gal

$19.63

James Austin

CLBLEACH61

6/gal

$9.90

Waxie

170018

3/128oz case

The contract is being warded to a single vendor, selected based on the majority of the lowest bid prices submitted. Items marked as "No Bid" by a vendor were excluded from the lowest bid calculation for all vendors. If the awarded vendor is unable to supply an item due to long backorder time, 

slow production, item being discontinued, etc., the District reserves the right to procure the item through another vendor.	
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13

Bottle 32 oz. w/ adjustable trigger Bottle & Trigger Better Brush, or approved equal 150

 $4.02

Price quoted per each

sold as 3/pack 

$1.32

Janico

Bottle32 & 32trigger

each

$1.52

per each

$2.36

Custom

93156

per each

$1.20

Btl-890036

Trigger-890177SA

per set

14

Bowl, Round, Black 24 oz, 9"x1-1/2" (69) 4/100 Gen Pak, Parpak, or approved equal 100

 $289.96

Variance: Size 9" x 2"

 50/Pack, 8 packs/Case  

$33.62

Genpak

GAB024

200 ct

$64.77

square w lid not round

300 ct

$51.59 

Sam Tell REDE

B24SB

252 ct

$63.52

Anchor

5104548426

360 ct

15

Bowl, foam 5 oz  Black 8/125 Gen Pak, Dart , or approved equal 100

$54.70

8/125pk

$17.22

Dart

5BWWC(WHITE)

1000 ct

$36.95

Dart

1000 ct

$42.47

Pactiv

YTH100040000

1250 ct

$31.33

Pactiv

11044410

1000 ct 

16

Bowl, Plastic, 12 oz (For both hot & cold foods) 500 (pcs per case) Parpak, or approved equal 100

 $29.78

Price quoted for 500/box

sold as 1000/case 

$44.45

WNA

24013WNA

500 ct

$21.93

Boardwalk

500 ct

$80.26

Genpak

72100

1000 ct

$45.34

WNA/Atrium

11298811

500 ct 

17

Bowl, Plastic, 16 oz (For both hot & cold foods) 500 (pcs per case) Parpak, or approved equal 50

$91.49

 500/Case 

$50.22

WNA

24017

500 ct

$70.52

Dart

500 ct

$66.67 

Sam Tell REDE

B16SB

504 ct

$51.22

WNA/Atrium

11298028

500 ct 

18

Bowl, Black Square 8 oz, plastic (73) 500 (pcs per case) Parpak, or approved equal 25

$84.48

 500/Case 

$43.27

WNA

5BB008BK

500 ct

$49.87

Dart

500 ct

$54.58 

Sam Tell REDE

B8SB

504 ct

$45.54

WNA/Atrium

51298151

250 ct 

matches lid on line73

19

Bowl, Squat, 12 oz - Must quote lids to fit (76) 20/25 Convermex, or approved equal 100

 $34.22

Price quoted for 500/box

sold as 1000/case 

$24.27

Covermex

12FC20

500 ct

$39.20

Dart

500 ct

$61.68 

Sam Tell REDE

B12SB

504 ct

$33.63

Dart 12SJ20

110289

500 ct

20

Bowl, Squat, 8 oz - Must quote lids to fit (76) 40/25 Convermex, or approved equal 200

$76.42

1000/case

$36.90

Covermex

8FC20

1000 ct

$47.15

Dart

1000 ct

$54.58 

Sam Tell REDE

B8SB

504 ct

$54.72

Dart 8B20

111654

1000 ct

21

Broom, Corn, Yucca, 42" Handle each Better Brush, or approved equal 200

 $13.87

Price quoted per each

sold as 12/case 

$9.03 

Better Brush

432028

each

$8.13

each

$10.88

Sam Tell REDE

CLCORNBR

each

$9.60 

Golden Star

2055501

each 

22

Broom, Large Angle w. Black Poly bristles 48", black metal handle each ABCO, or approved equal 100

 $19.04

Price quoted per each

sold as 6/case 

$3.68

ABCO

BR1024MH1

each

$4.85

each

$19.88 

Winco

BRAU-9K-H

each

$6.02 

Malish Corp

205550

each

23

Bucket, Mop w/ Wringer, 26qt each Better Brush, or approved equal 50

$59.56 $47.56

ABCO

T01008

each

$58.65

each

$70.44

Stanton Trading

MBC-35

each

$56.76

Impact 9Y/2636-3Y

#650101

each

24

Bun Rack Covers, 52X80 4/50 Elkay Plastic, or approved equal 200

$118.63

 50/Box, 4 Boxes/Case 

$12.77

Elkay

BOR5280HD

50 ct

$19.99

50 ct

$20.23

Elkay Plastics

22-SB52D

50 ct

$14.77

Heritage Bag

700144

50 ct
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25

Can liner 1 mil 40x46 black 45 gal 100 Republic/Victoria Bay, or approved equal 800

 $38.79

Variance: 1.1 Mil 

$13.49

Victoria Bay

VBLH404610B

100 ct

$21.39

100 ct

$21.29

Heritage Bag CO

X7845SK2X01

100 ct

$23.71

Heritage Bag

700147

100 ct

26

Cleanser, All Purpose, Liquid, Pine 4/1 gal Hi-Value, 409,or approved equal 20

$64.24

 4/1 gal 

$20.85

Midlab

D00993

4/ 1 gal

$25.93

4/ 1 gal

$39.85

The Clorox CO

PINESOL

GALLON

3/1 gal

$23.19

Waxie 

322441

4/1gal

27

Cleanser, All Purpose, Powder 24/21 oz Comet/Ajax, or approved equal 25

$67.26

 24/21 Oz 

$32.60

Ajax

Ajax

24/21 oz

$42.53

24/21oz

$24.53

Colgate-Palmolive

CLCPL04279

20 /21oz

$35.10

Waxie

870296

24/21oz 

28

Clear Food Storage Bag, Large, 27x37-BunPan Cover 200 Elkay Plastic, or approved equal 200

$41.28

200/case

$12.88

Elkay

BOR2537HD

200 ct

$36.96

200 ct

$32.84

Elkay Plastics

BOR21635LD

200 ct

$13.15

Elkay

51805264

200 ct

29

Clear Food Storage Bag, 52 x 80 150

 $29.86

Price quoted and

sold as 50/case 

$12.77

Elkay

BOR5280HD

50 ct

$23.20

50 ct

$20.23

Elkay Plastics

22-SB52D

50 ct

$13.03

Elkay

51805028

50 ct

30

Clear Food Storage Bag, Small 12X8X30 500 Elkay Plastic, or approved equal 100

$64.23

 500 ct

$35.55

Elkay

8G128030

500 ct

$62.07

500 ct

$50.65 

Elkay Plastics

128030

500 ct

$26.50

Elkay

51805196

500 ct

31

Container, 8 oz, Deli Clear w/ Attached Lid 2/100 Dart, or approved equal 150

$40.70

 100/Pack, 2 Packs/Case 

$18.85

Genpak

AD08

200 ct

$31.42

200 ct

$33.92 

Genpak

AD08F

200 ct

$24.09

Dart CH8DEF

51000008

200 ct

32

Cup, 2 oz Portion, Black, Round-  must work with lid quoted (72) 2500 On the go, or approved equal 100

$29.30

 2500/Case 

$16.37

Victoria Bay 

VBPCP2B

2500 ct

$41.42

Genuine Joe

2500 ct

$42.18

Sam Tell REDE

PC200B

2500 ct

$19.56

Amhil 

11600308

2500 ct

33

Cups, 12 oz, Foam (For Coffee)  must quote lid to fit (71) 1000 Convermex, or approved equal 50

$63.60

  25/Bag, 40 Bags/Carton 

$40.85

Convermax

12B16

1000 ct

$57.55

Genuine Joe

1000 ct

$57.94 

Moducup

1512

1000 ct

$42.93

Dart 12J12

110110

1000 ct

34

Cups, 12/14 oz Squat must quote lid to fit (70) 1000 (pcs per case) Fabri-Kal, or approved equal 20

$86.54

 1000/Case 

$32.11

Victoria Bay

VBCCSPET12

1000 ct

$54.76

Dart

1000 ct

$85.55

Fabri-Kal

KC12S

1000 ct

$43.55

Amhil ACR12

11262013

1000 ct

35

Cups, 16 oz, Styrofoam (Drink Cup) must quote lid to fit (74) 20/25 Convermex, or approved equal 400

$52.98

 20/Bag, 25 Bags/Carton 

$25.43

Convermex

16B16

500 ct

$38.62

Dart

500 ct

$72.43

Moducup

1516

1000 ct

$62.00

Dart 16J16

110145

1000 ct

36

Cups, Plastic Portion 5.5 oz, Clear must quote lid to fit (75) 2500 On The Go, or approved equal 200

$64.47

 2,500/Carton 

$30.42

Victoria Bay

VBPCP55C

2500 ct

$64.90

Dart

2500 ct

$59.52

Sam Tell REDE

EPC550

2500 ct

$36.78

Amhil

11600317

2500 ct

37

Cups, 8 oz, Styrofoam (Drink Cup) 40/25 Convermex, or approved equal 20

$60.14

 25/Bag, 40 Bags/Carton 

$27.54

Convermex

8B8

1000 ct

$30.41

Dart

1000 ct

$48.20

Moducup

8H

1000 ct

$30.24

Dart 8J8

11021003

1000 ct
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38

Cups, 9 oz, Clear (For Smoothies) must quote lid to fit (77) 1000 Fabri-Kal, or approved equal 20

$78.37

 1000/Case 

$34.61

Victoria Bay

VBCLCPET9TC

1000 ct

$36.08

Boardwalk

1000 ct

$91.44

Pactiv

YE9

2500 ct

$37.40

Amhil

11262010

1000 ct

39

Cups, Clear, 12 oz., For Smoothies must quote lid to fit (78) 1000 Fabri-Kal, or approved equal 20

$83.14

 1000/Case 

$32.69

Victoria Bay

VG12CF

1000 ct

$56.19

Boardwalk

1000 ct

$85.55

Fabri-Kal

KC12S

1000 ct

$43.55

Amhil ACR12

11262013

1000 ct

40 Cup, plastic clear 16oz. must quote lid to fit (79) 1000 PET, or approved equal

20

$87.91

 1000/Case 

$36.61

Victoria bay

VG16CF

1000 ct

$81.24

Dart

1000 ct

$145.29

Fabri-Kal

GC16S-PLAIN

1000 ct

$44.49

Amhil

11262510

1000 ct

41

Deck Brush, Scrub, w/ Plastic Fill single Better Brush, or approved equal 25

$16.59 $2.58

Better Brush

230210

each

$5.42

each

$8.47 

CFS Brands

3619200

each

$5.54

Malish 62410

10562410

each

42

Deck Mop #16 with handle, 14 oz each Crystal Lake, or approved equal 300

 $8.67

Price quoted per each.Sold 

as 6/case

Variance : 16oz 

$2.91

ABCO

CD50016

each

$36.53

Boardwalk

each

$5.35

CFS Brands

369066B00

each

$5.94

Golden Star AWM7916

657916

each

43

Degreaser Heavy Duty 4/1 gal Hi-Valu, or approved equal 55

$34.12

 4/1 Gal 

$21.99

Midlab

D00998

4/1 gal

$39.35

Boardwalk

4/1 gal

$47.73

Simoniz

LIKEMAGIC41

$44.39

Waxie Brkawsy

410016

4/1 gal

44

Deodorizer, Jell Mixture Concentrate 12/1 qt EES, or approved equal 25

70.30

 12/1 Qt 

$75.25

EES Inc. Spray-a-jell

FG9958QT

12 qt

$133.33

12/1 qt

$15.95

Sam Tell & Son

CLSTPINE4

4/1 gal

$34.84

Smart Odor Neut

16006132

6/32oz

45

Tray, 5 oz. Clear Square Dish 15MIL 2500 Parpak, or approved equal 50

$156.33

 2500/Case 

$36.98

Pactiv

R4196

2500 ct

$79.30

2500 ct

$99.98

WNA Comet

PACUPJET5

1000 ct

$71.32

WNA/Atrium

51029829

2500 ct

46

Disinfecting Wipes, Antibacterial 6/200ct Sani Wipe, or approved equal 25

$69.38

 200/Canister, 6 

Canisters/Carton 

$42.60

Sani-Wipe

P22884

6pack / 200 ct

$48.73

6 canisters/200 ct

$39.06

Clorox

38358948

6 ct

$43.49

Sani-Wipe

17109018

6/200 ct

47

Dolly (for 20-55 gallon containers) each Better Brush, or approved equal 55

$33.38

each

$28.87

Better Brush

210305

each

$29.47

each

$57.97

CFS Brands

3691103

each

$32.92

Rubbermaid FG264000

730730

each

48

Dust Pan, Long Handle each Better Brush, or approved equal 55

$7.94

each

$6.66

ABCO

DP002045H

$11.24

each

$17.94

CFS Brands

36141003

each

$10.64

Impact 26" handle

190070  

each

49

Film Wrap, 12" Cutter Box 2000 ft roll Foodpak, or approved equal 150

$20.68

2000' roll

$10.78

Victoria Bay

12x2M

roll

$15.13

Boardwalk

per 2000' roll

$12.75

Anchor Packaging

ST12X25

per roll

$9.25

Anchor/Smart

5107304351

12" x 2000'

per roll

50

Film Wrap, 18" 2000 ft roll Foodpak, or approved equal 150

$30.07

2000' roll

$14.97

Victoria Bay

18X2M

roll

$22.48

Boardwalk

per 2000' roll

$18.31

Anchor Packaging

ST18X2F

per roll

$12.98

Anchor/Smart

5107304352

18" x 2000'

per roll
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51

Foil Bag, Hamburger/Sandwich 1000 ct Brown, or approved equal 55

$92.65

1000/case

$52.40

Bagcraft

300533

1000 ct

$78.92

1000 ct

$82.88

Bagcraft

300527

1000 ct

$58.31

Bagcraft

51008546

1000 ct

52

Foil Bag, Hotdog 1000 ct Brown, or approved equal 55

$94.01

1000/case

$62.40

Bagcraft

300456

1000 ct

$82.54

1000 ct

$62.12

Bagcraft

300455

1000 ct

$65.45

Bagcraft

51004610

1000 ct

53

Forks Black Wrapped Heavy Duty no napkin 1000 ct AmerCare/Wellchoice, or approved equal 2000

$29.63

 1000/Case 

$16.84

Victoria Bay

IPP2FB

1000 ct

$20.56

Boardwalk

1000 ct

$28.91

Prime Source

75002966

1000 ct

$19.21

Banyan/Smart

11600105

1000 ct

54

Gloves, Cleaning, Flocklined 12/ea Safety-zone, or approved equal 50

$13.13

 12 pairs/case 

$4.16

YT Sourcing

75005740B

per dozen

$8.87

per dozen

$0.68 

Safety Zone

CLGLOVEYL

per pair

$5.19

Amercare 599-3

79198106

12pr/pack

55

Gloves, Vinyl, L 10/100cs Safety Zone, or approved equal 250

$33.07

1000/case

$13.95

Victoria Bay

64V3000PFL

1000 ct

$27.04

Ammex

1000 ct

$124.31

Safety Zone

GVDR-LG-1C

10 ct

$18.49

Amercare/Individual

790562

10/100ct

56

Gloves, Vinyl, M 10/100cs Safety Zone, or approved equal 150

$34.79

1000/case

$13.95

Victoria Bay

64V3000PFM

1000 ct

$27.04

Ammex

1000 ct

$117.54

Safety Zone

GVDL-MD-1C

10/100ct

$18.49

Amercare/Individual

790563

10/100ct

57

Gloves, Vinyl, XL 10/100cs Safety Zone, or approved equal 150

33.82

1000/case

$13.95

Victoria Bay

64V3000PFXL

1000 ct

$27.04

Ammex

1000 ct

$117.54 

Safety Zone

GVDL-XL-1C

10/100 ct

$18.49

Amercare/Individual

790565

10/100ct

58

Gloves, Vinyl, XXL 10/100cs Safety Zone, or approved equal 150

$44.25

1000/case

$24.80

Safety Zone

GVP9XXL1C

1000 ct

$28.77

Ammex

1000 ct

$159.38

Safety Zone

GVDR-2X-1C

10/100 ct

$18.49

Amercare/Individual

79022995

10/100ct

59

Goggles, Chemical Resistant Safety Zone, or approved equal 55

 $3.37

Price quoted per each

sold as 12/case 

$1.40

Hospeco

ESGP

each

$2.45

MCR Safety

each

$4.39

Allpoints

851175

each

$2.89

D & J Imports

79310020

each

60

Hair Bonnets (Large - 21") 500/pack Safety Zone, or approved equal 50

$21.24

 500/Pack 

$22.20

Tradex

BC21WHT

1000 ct

$24.86

1000 ct

$139.91

Disco

K2020BR

1000 ct

$4.97

Amercare RP110NWP

51013103

100ct 

61

Hair Bonnets (Small - 19") 500/pack Safety Zone, or approved equal 25

$23.28

 500/Pack 

$27.90

Hospeco

DBWH195

1000ct

No Bid $128.27

Disco

K2018BR

1000 ct

NO BID

62

Hand Sanitizer, Foam, for Dispenser - must work with current dispencer - Purell 

touch-free hand santizer - SKU: 2720-12
2/1.2 L Purell, or approved equal 50

 $55.41

Price quoted for 2/case 

sold as 4/case 

$59.79

GOJO Purell

539202

2-1.2L

$67.97

2/1200 ml

$101.50

GOJO

8561-04

4 ct

$37.46

Purell ES4 5053-02

389805

2/1200ml

63

Hand Sanitizer, Pump Bottles 4/2 liter pumps Purell, or approved equal 20

 $100.86

Variance: 1.5L

 4/1.5 L  

$51.90

GOJO Purell

501504

4-1.5L

$65.32

Zep 

4/1 gal

$53.29

Unified Solutions

HAND SANITIZER

4/1 gal

$51.67

GOJO Purell 5015-04

390012

4/1.5 Ltr

5



Description Unit Description Brand Estimated Usage
Agni Enterprises LLC

dba Head to Heels
COPACO/Imperial Dade

Malone Office 

Environments
Sam Tell & Son Inc.

Southeastern Paper 

Group

The contract is being warded to a single vendor, selected based on the majority of the lowest bid prices submitted. Items marked as "No Bid" by a vendor were excluded from the lowest bid calculation for all vendors. If the awarded vendor is unable to supply an item due to long backorder time, 

slow production, item being discontinued, etc., the District reserves the right to procure the item through another vendor.	

PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES

BID SUMMARY

INVITATION TO BID 25-022

64

Handle, Deck Scrub Brush - must work with scrub brush each Better Brush, or approved equal 55

$9.12

each

$2.11

ABCO

HANDLE1102

each

$4.80

each

$7.15

CFS Brands

4026100

each

$3.81

60" Ext metal thread 

handle

65151660

each

65

Handle, Mop (Wingnut Wooden Saddle Type) - must work with mop head each Better Brush, or approved equal 150

$13.48

each

$6.29

ABCO

00303NB

each

$11.42

each

$14.30

CFS Brands

3696800

each

$7.81

60" Quick Change

656011 

each

66

Handle, tapered for floor squeegee Better Brush, or approved equal 50

$10.92

each

$2.80

ABCO

1112EB

each

$5.19

each

$7.15

CFS Brands

4026100

each

$5.24

Rubbermaid FG6362

1050636200 

each

67

Lid for Steamtable Pan, 1/2 size - must work with pan (85) case (100 pc) Durable, or approved equal 150

$34.09

 100/Case 

$19.18

Victoria Bay

VBHLF

100 ct

$20.15

Boardwalk

100 ct

$39.37

American Alupack Ind

PAFOILHALFLID

100 ct

$16.67

Ocala/Smart

51600256

100ct case

68

Lid for Steamtable Pan, full - must work with pan (86) case (50 pc) Durable, or approved equal 200

$40.42

 50/Case 

$22.48

Victoria Bay

VBFSL

50 ct

$24.38

Boardwalk

50 ct

$26.43 

American Alupack Ind 

PAFOILFULLFLID

50 ct

$17.34

Ocala/Smart

51600255

50ct case

69

Lid, 8-7/8", for 24 oz round Bowl - must work with 24 oz. bowl bid (14) 4/50 Gen Pak, Parpak, or approved equal 100

$139.79

50/Box, 4 Boxes/Case

$28.45

Genpak

GAB932

200 ct

see item 14

bowl & lid together

$63.68 

Sam  Tell REDE

C2464BDL

252 ct

59.50

Anchor 4308427

5104308427

360ct

70

Lids for 12/14 oz Squat Cups - must work with cup (34) 1000 (pcs per case) Fabri-Kal, or approved equal 20

$55.89

 1000/Case 

$13.93

Victoria Bay

F98HCF

1000 ct

$36.93

Dart

1000 ct

$46.62

Fabri-Kal

LGC1220

1000 ct

$32.86

Amhil/Smart A626P

11262540

1000ct

71

Lids, 12 oz, Sip, for Foam Coffee Cup must work with cup bid (33) 1000 Convermex, or approved equal 25

$64.11

 1000/Case 

$34.19

Convermex

L-16B

1000 ct

$46.78

Genuine Joe

1000 ct

$27.83

Moducup

16HL

1000 ct

$28.60

Dart 12FTLS

110288

1000 ct 

72

Lids, 2 oz Round Portion Cup must work with cup bid (32) 2500 Fabri-Kal, On The Go, or approved equal 100

$26.34

 2500/Case 

$14.32

Victoria Bay

VBPCLT2

2500 ct

$45.05

Genuine Joe

2500 ct

$28.19 

Sam Tell  REDE

EPCLID2

2500 ct

$17.00

Amhil/Smart

11600310

2500 ct 

73

Lids, Clear, Square, For 8-16 oz Containers must work with cup bid (18) 500 Parpak, or approved equal 50

$77.02

 500/Case 

$44.45

WNA

5BB200DL

500 ct

$47.90

Dart

504 ct

$47.95 

Sam Tell  REDE

C816BDL

504 ct

$52.90

WNA/Atrium 82639

11298152

250ct  matches base on 

line 18

74

Lids, Straw Slot, 16 oz Styro Drink Cups must work with cup bid (35) 10/100 Convermex, or approved equal 150

$38.26

 100/Pack, 10 

Packs/Carton 

$24.17

Convermex

L16ST

1000 ct

$31.96

Dart

1000 ct

$27.83 

Moducup

16HL

1000 ct

$26.67

Amhil/Smart 16SL

11262027

1000 ct

75

Lids, for 5.5oz clear cup (S19B2) must work with cup bid (36) 2500 Fabri-Kal, On The Go, or approved equal 150

$40.23

 2,500/Carton 

$20.09

Victoria Bay

VBPCLT4

2500 ct

$34.19

Dart

2500 ct

$35.97

Sam Tell REDE

EPCLID3

2500 ct

$22.67

Amhil/Smart

11600318

2500 ct 

76

Lids, for Squat 8 & 12 oz Bowls must work with cup bid (19) 10/100 Convermex, or approved equal 150

$38.26

 1000/Case 

$26.66

Convermex

LVFC20

1000 ct

$33.81

Dart

500 ct

$47.95

Sam Tell  REDE

C816BDL

504 ct

$32.40

Amhil/Smart 20JL

11262030

1000 ct

6



Description Unit Description Brand Estimated Usage
Agni Enterprises LLC

dba Head to Heels
COPACO/Imperial Dade

Malone Office 

Environments
Sam Tell & Son Inc.

Southeastern Paper 

Group

The contract is being warded to a single vendor, selected based on the majority of the lowest bid prices submitted. Items marked as "No Bid" by a vendor were excluded from the lowest bid calculation for all vendors. If the awarded vendor is unable to supply an item due to long backorder time, 

slow production, item being discontinued, etc., the District reserves the right to procure the item through another vendor.	

PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES

BID SUMMARY

INVITATION TO BID 25-022

77

Lids, w/ Straw Slot, 9 & 12 oz portions (smoothies) must work with cup bid (38) 1000 Fabri-Kal, or approved equal 25

$45.65

 1000/Case 

$25.25

Victoria Bay

F78HCF

2000 ct

$26.74

Boardwalk

1000 ct

$55.03

Pactiv

DFL122

1000 ct

$32.86

Amhil/Smart A626P

11262540

1000 ct

78

Lids, Dome for Clear Cup, 12 oz., For Smoothies must work with cup bid (39) Fabri-Kal, or approved equal 25

 $49.74

Price quoted and 

sold as 1000/case 

$22.66

Victoria Bay

VBDLNH92

1000 ct

$26.74

Boardwalk

1000 ct

$55.94

Pactiv

DDL122CLR

1000 ct

$42.54

Amhil/Smart ADL626

11262555

1000 ct

79 Lid, plastic for 16 oz. cup must work with cup bid (40) 1000 PET, or approved equal

20

$55.89

1000/case

$13.93

Victoria Bay

F98HCF

1000 ct

$30.50

Dart

1000 ct

$55.03

Pactiv

DFL122

1200 ct

$32.86

Amhil/Smart A626P

11262540

1000 ct

80

Mop, Head 24oz ea Better Brush, or approved equal 300

 $5.29

Price quoted per each.

sold as 12/case 

$3.22

ABCO

CM2024SB

each

$7.92

each

$9.14

CFS Brands

369074B00

each

$2.64

Kleenline

650129

priced per each

81

Napkins, Xpress, Mega - must work with current dispenser - Scott MEGACartridge 

Pole Kit #09135
6/875 Kimberly Clark, or approved equal 1000

$100.39

875/pack, 6 packs/carton

$64.48

Kimberly Clark

DX900

6000 ct

$66.02

875/pack 6

5250 ct

$60.51 

Tork

DX600

6000 ct

$57.48

Mega Napkin 98908

111902

6/875ct

82

Neutral Cleaner 4/1 gal Hi-Valu, or approved equal 20

$60.68

4/1 gal

$21.14

Midlab

VB00993

4/ 1 gal

$25.24

4/ 1 gal

$31.44

Sam Tell & Son

TEARCLEAR41

4/1 gal

$25.77

Waxie Lemon Neutral

322110

4/1 gal

83

Oven Cleaner, Easy Off, Foam Aerosol 12/14.5oz Easy Off, or approved equal 50

$76.15

12/14.5 oz

$37.80

Victoria Bay

K00093

12/12oz

$49.98

12/ 14.5 oz

$38.40

Diversey

CBD991206

6/19 oz

$19.38

Waxie/PLZ

1031531

6/20oz

84

Pan Liners, 16 x 24 10/1000 Durable, or approved equal 350

$664.78

1000/box, 10box case

$39.20

Victoria Bay

VBF25Q

1000 ct

$63.28

1000 ct

$56.33 

Prime Source

PAPANL

1000 ct

$41.65

Bagcraft

51008206

1000 ct 

85

Pans, Steamtable, 1/2 size deep - must work with lid (67) case (50 pc) Durable, or approved equal 150

 $24.91

Price quoted for 50/box

sold as 100/carton 

$29.28

Victoria Bay

VBSHHSP

100 ct

$36.36

Boardwalk

100 ct

$53.43

Sam Tell  REDE

PAFOILHALFDEEP

100 ct

$25.29

Ocala/Smart

51600254

100 ct 

86

Pans, Steamtable, Full deep - must work with lid (68) case (50 pieces) Durable, or approved equal 200

$73.95

50/case

$46.64

Victoria bay

VBFDSPLT

50 ct

$54.92

Boardwalk

50 ct

$54.67 

Handifoil

PAPFOILFULL DEEP

50 ct 

$37.13

Ocala/Smart

51600247

50 ct 

87

Paper Towels, brown roll - must work with current dispenser - Tork Mechanical 

Hand Towel Roll #772828
6/roll (ea) SCA, or approved equal 150

$58.13

6roll/ case

$40.87

Tork

8031300

6/800' rl per case

$66.91

630'rl/ 6 rl per case

$67.64 

Tork

8031300

6rl/ case

$41.70

SCA/Tork H80

856224

6/800'

Use Tork Dispenser-

772828

88

Pine Oil Cleaner, Pine Sol 4/gal Hi-Valu, or approved equal 200

$36.89

4/1 gal

$20.86

Midlab

C00160

4/ 1 gal

$23.42

4/ 1gal

$34.80 

The Clorox CO

35419

3/144 oz

$23.19

Waxie

322441

4/1 gal

89

Plate, Foam  6" 1000 Gen Pak, Darnell, or approved equal 50

$29.67

1000/case

$18.83

Dart

6PWC

1000 ct

$24.22

Dart

1000 ct

$29.15

Pactiv

UTH10006UPCL

1000 ct

$17.17

Dart 6PWCR

115061

1000 ct

7



Description Unit Description Brand Estimated Usage
Agni Enterprises LLC

dba Head to Heels
COPACO/Imperial Dade

Malone Office 

Environments
Sam Tell & Son Inc.

Southeastern Paper 

Group

The contract is being warded to a single vendor, selected based on the majority of the lowest bid prices submitted. Items marked as "No Bid" by a vendor were excluded from the lowest bid calculation for all vendors. If the awarded vendor is unable to supply an item due to long backorder time, 

slow production, item being discontinued, etc., the District reserves the right to procure the item through another vendor.	

PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES

BID SUMMARY

INVITATION TO BID 25-022

90

Sandwich Container w/ hinge lid, clear (hot & cold food) - 6" 500 Durable, or approved equal 25

$75.00

125/pack 4/packs carton

$41.37

Pactiv

YC1821600000

500 ct

$102.57

Pactiv Evergreen

321 ct

$55.03 

Pactiv

YC1821600000

500 ct

$42.22

Pactiv YCI8216

51044658

500 ct 

91

Scouring Pad, Heavy Duty 6/10 ct Royal, or approved equal 100

 $37.74

Price quoted and sold as 

15/pack

4/pack/case 

$3.82

3M

86

15 ct

$41.76

60 ct

$16.75

Scrubble/ACS

356492

60 ct

$16.21

Royal  S960

99054228

6/10ct

92

Scrubber, Stainless Steel 6/12 ct Royal, or approved equal 300

$37.12

12/10 ct

$5.98

Royal

S7306

6/12 ct

$104.34

12/6pk

$9.64

Stanton Trading

1836

12 ct

$3.89

Royal S730

99054099

12ct pack

93

Soap, Hand foam - must work with current dispenser, Foaming  Luxury Hand Soap, 

Designer Series/EZ Foam Wall Mount #69041
6/1000 ml (33.8 oz) Kutol, or approved equal 100

$76.26

6/1000ml

$37.70

Kutol

KU-69041

6/1000 ml

$59.94

6 bags 33.8 oz

$62.52

Simoniz

C06641000

8 ct

$51.77

Purell Healthy Soap 

417108

38417108

6/1000ml

94

Soap Pads 12/10 ct Royal, or approved equal 50

$61.00

12/10ct

$47.78

Clorox SOS

CLOX88320

15/12 packs 180ea

$47.97

120 ct

$54.11

Disco

SP1210BRILLO

120 ct

$30.71

Royal S1012

99054012

12/10ct case

95

Spoons, Black Wrapped Heavy Duty- no napkin 1000 ct AmerCare/Wellchoice, or approved equal 2000

$30.29

1000/case

$16.84

Victoria Bay

IPP2TSB

1000 ct

$20.09 

Boardwalk

1000 ct

$28.91

Prime Source

75002968

1000 ct

$19.21

Banyan/Smart

11600107

1000 ct

96

Spray-N-Go RTU Sanitizer 12/1 qt Harvard, or approved equal 25

$109.84

12/1 qt

$22.76 

Midlab

C00187

12/ 1qt

$27.58

12/1 qt

$23.40 

Synthetic Labs

2101NO-RINSE

6/32 oz

$21.80

Purell Foodservice RTU

170054

6/32oz

97

Floor Squeegee 22" Moss Foam Rubber twin rubber blade - must work with handle 

bid

each Better Brush, or approved equal 50

$20.81

each

$5.15

Better Brush

270422

each

$11.20

each

$12.66 

CFS Brands

36632400

each

$7.05

Rubbermaid 9C27

29000927

formerly 88RCP9C27

each

98

Stainless Steel cleaner 12/10oz case Sheila Shine, or approved equal 50

$117.39

12/10 oz

$39.46

Victoria Bay

K01010

12/ 15 oz

$90.86

12/ 10oz

$35.93

Simoniz

S3336006

6/15 oz

$64.98

Spartan

1631000

12/20oz 

99

Straws, Reg Drinking, 5-7/8" Milk Straws, Clear Wrapped case Cardinal, or approved equal 25

 $75.62

Price quoted and sold as 

12000/case

Variance: Size 5 3/4" 

$99.07

Hoffmaster

600253

3200 ct

$216.75

3200 ct

$37.37

Sam Tell REDE

E575RS

12000 ct

$28.09

Banyan/Smart

11600218

24/500ct 

100

Straws, XLarge, Unwrapped, 5-3/4" Black, Smoothie 50/150 Cardinal, or approved equal 25

 $197.19

Price quoted for 7500/case

sold as 2000/case 

$56.66

Lollicup

C9030

3500 ct

$270.72

20000 ct

$79.21

Cell-O-Core

830341

12,500 ct

$56.29

D & W

11004805

50/250ct  

101

Tissue, Facial, 2 Ply 30/box Atlas, Tork, or approved equal 50

 $26.35

Price quoted for 100 

sheets/box

sold as 30 boxes/carton 

$12.75

Victoria Bay

VBFACIAL

30 box

$22.79

Genuine Joe

100sht bx/30bx

$43.66

Tork

TF6710A

30 ct

$24.06

Tork TF6710A

856085

30/100ct 

102

Toilet Brush each Better Brush, or approved equal 55

 $7.98

Price quoted per each

sold as 24/case 

$0.93

ABCO

0017

each

$1.60

each

$3.94 

Winco

BR-15SET

each

$1.91

Rubbermaid FG6310

2060671

each

103

Toilet Tissue - Must work with current dispenser - Tork 3 roll bath tissue roll 

dispenser #565828
36/ea (roll) Tork, or approved equal 150

 $67.57

Price quoted and

sold as 800 sht/rl 

36 rl//case 

$48.76

Tork

61990

36 rl/865st

$63.12

800 sht rl/36 tl case

$75.85

Tork

161990

36 rl case

$52.99

Tork 110292A

851665

36rl /1000 st

8



Description Unit Description Brand Estimated Usage
Agni Enterprises LLC

dba Head to Heels
COPACO/Imperial Dade

Malone Office 

Environments
Sam Tell & Son Inc.

Southeastern Paper 

Group

The contract is being warded to a single vendor, selected based on the majority of the lowest bid prices submitted. Items marked as "No Bid" by a vendor were excluded from the lowest bid calculation for all vendors. If the awarded vendor is unable to supply an item due to long backorder time, 

slow production, item being discontinued, etc., the District reserves the right to procure the item through another vendor.	

PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES

BID SUMMARY

INVITATION TO BID 25-022

104

Trash Can - 32 gallon each Impact, or approved equal 25

$44.32

each

$22.49

ABCO

BS-32G

each

$34.62

each

$38.25 

CFS Brands

84103223

each

$26.95

Rubbermaid FG263200

730610

each

105

Trash Can - 55 gallon each Impact, or approved equal 25

$125.67

each

$61.29

Better Brush

210155GY

each

$63.53

each

$95.13 

CFS Brands

84105523

each

$58.90 

Rubbermaid FG265500

730710

each

106

Trash Can Dolly (20-55 gal capacity) each Impact, or approved equal 50

$33.38

each

$19.19

ABCO

BS-32G

each

$29.98

each

$57.97

CFS Brands

3691103

each

$32.92 

Rubbermaid FG264000

730730

each

107

Trash Can Lid - 32 gallon each Impact, or approved equal 25

$23.85

each

$5.51

ABCO

32-T

each

$9.42

each

$12.62 

CFS Brands

84103323

each

$8.81 

Rubbermaid FG263100

730640

each

108

Trash Can Lid - 55 gallon each Impact, or approved equal 20

$43.76

each

$11.19

Better Brush

210255GY

each

$12.68

each

$30.41 

CFS Brands

84105623

each

$21.48 

Rubbermaid FG265400

730720

each

109

Trays, #1, Fries 1000 Hotpack, or approved equal 100

$41.93

1000/case

$19.91

Victoria Bay

8701VB

1000 ct

$24.96

1000 ct

$25.01

Specialty Quality

Packaging

738701

1000 ct

$18.82

SCT 0413

11009298

1000 ct 

110

Trays, #2, Nacho 1000 Hotpack, or approved equal 350

$40.85

1000/case

$21.02

Victoria Bay

8702VB

1000 ct

$27.05

1000 ct

$30.45

Specialty  Quality

Packaging

8702

1000 ct

$21.96

SCT 0417

5100417

1000 ct

111

Trays, 3 Compartment Hinged, 9"X9"X3 2/100 Dart, GenPak, or approved equal 2000

$36.66

100 bag/ 2 bag carton

$18.05

Dart

90HT3R

200 ct

$20.64

200 ct

$22.75 

Pactiv

YTD199030000

150 ct

$21.82

Ecopax

51744005

200 ct

112

Trays, 5 Compartment, Polystyrene foam, black, 8.31" W x 10.25" L x 1.08" H 500 Npxone, or approved equal 7000

$53.57

500/case

$23.33

Pactiv

YTHB0500

500 ct

$32.47

Pactiv Evergreen

500 ct

$37.58 

Pactiv

YTH10500SGBX

200 ct

$23.50

Pactiv

11044504

500 ct

113

Trays, Clear Hinged Deep, 8 1/4"X8 1/4"X3 250 Dart, Durable, or approved equal 1000

$72.40

250/case

$41.11

Dart

C90PST1

250 ct

$49.62

250 ct

$68.24 

Dartcntrl

C90PST1

250 ct

$34.10

Pactiv

51044656

200 ct

114

Trays, Clear Hinged Shallow, 8 1/4"X8 1/4"X2 250 Dart, Durable, or approved equal 50

$82.31

125 bag/2 bag carton

$45.55

Dart

C89PST1

250 ct

$61.55

250 ct

$42.33 

Pactiv

YC18-1120-0000

200 ct

$46.48

Dart

11021560

250 ct

115

Trays, 1 Compartment Hinged 9x9x3 250 Dart, GenPak, or approved equal 100

 $44.34

Price quoted for 250/case. 

Sold as 100/bag 

2bag/carton 

$18.05

Dart

90HT1R

200 ct

$24.72

200 ct

$37.86 

Pactiv

YCN809010000

120 ct

$21.82

Ecopax

51014268

200 ct

9



Description Unit Description Brand Estimated Usage
Agni Enterprises LLC

dba Head to Heels
COPACO/Imperial Dade

Malone Office 

Environments
Sam Tell & Son Inc.

Southeastern Paper 

Group

The contract is being warded to a single vendor, selected based on the majority of the lowest bid prices submitted. Items marked as "No Bid" by a vendor were excluded from the lowest bid calculation for all vendors. If the awarded vendor is unable to supply an item due to long backorder time, 

slow production, item being discontinued, etc., the District reserves the right to procure the item through another vendor.	

PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES

BID SUMMARY

INVITATION TO BID 25-022

116

T-Shirt Mega Thank You Beige 700/cs ANS Plastic, or approved equal 50

$23.84

700/case

$20.48

Hilex

13X8X22BEIG

900 ct

$24.32

500 ct

$29.73 

Sam Tell REDE

8336T6TUL

500 ct

$26.00

Elkay

51011297

1000 ct

117

Wax Paper Sheets, 12" x 10-3/4" 500/bx 500/bx Brown, or approved equal 100

 $11.66

Price quoted for 500/box

sold as 6000/case 

$4.51

Victoria Bay

VB1210B

500 ct

$6.59

500 ct

$6.02 

Durable Packaging

SW-12

500 ct

$5.28

Durable SW-12

51040012

500ct 

118

Window Cleaner, Glass 4/1 gal Hi-Valu, or approved equal 25

$46.82

4/1 gal

$18.54

Midlab

F00005

4/1 gal

$39.00

4/1 gal

$43.14 

SC Johnson

CLDR0940Z

4/1 gal

$21.39

Waxie Sparkle

950144

4/1 gal

119

Wipes, Lysol Disinfectant 6/80ct Lemon Lime Blossom 6/80ct Lysol, or approved equal 50

$42.70

80 per canister/6 canisters 

per carton

$27.08

Lysol

RB-77182

6/80ct

27.56

6/80ct 

$39.06 

Clorox

38385948

6/ct

$50.66

GOJO/Purell 9341-06

170248

6/110ct

120

Baking Tray, Round, 8oz. 4.63"x4.63"x1.19", Kraft Release Coated Paperboard 700/cs Solut or approved equal 100

$154.49

700/case

$93.40

Solut

9088880700

700 ct

127.04

700 ct

NO BID $86.98

Solute 90888

51399001

700 ct

121 Baking Cup, White, Fluted, 4.5" Diameter top, 2" bottom, 1.25" wall 500/pk Soleil Lace or approved equal

100

 $6.32

Price quoted for 500/box

sold as 10000/case 

$2.89

Soleil Lace

45BCB

500 ct

$3.86

Hoffmaster

500 ct

$68.79 

Packnwood

8NPCPST7M

500 ct

$52.71

Hoffmaster 610032

51139461

20/500ct 

if awarded will request 

this to be splitable

0 85 3 8 25
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