PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES
INVITATION TO BID 24-017
BID SUMMARY

The recommendation of award is based on the vendor with the majority of low bid prices. Calculation does not include the items highlighted in blue where a bid price was not submitted.

Devi Enterprises LLC /
11400 Inc. hy P
Description Unit Description Brand Lol Cop_aco b Head to Heels Safety Nottage LLC St ey
Imperial Dade . Group
Supplies
$26.39 $18.16 $72.25 $31.89 $23.67
Aluminum Foil, Heavy Duty, 18X500 500 ft roll Crystalware, or approved equal Choice Handi Foil/Victoria Bay Boardwalk Victoria Bay Ocala
#12218X5HD #51807 #BWK7134 #51803 #SM18HDRF500
$11.76 $7.24
$9.49 $6.00 $14.13 Victoria Bay Ocala
. . " " Choice Victoria Bay Boardwalk #59100VB #SMIPUFS500
Aluminum, Foil Sheet, 9" x 10-3/: box Crystalware, or approved equal #1229105BX 459100VB SBWKT162 S00/BX Pack 6/500
500/BX 500/BX 500/BX $70.58 $43.54
3000/CS 3000/CS
$4.79 $5.47 $14.78 $6.57 $10.76
Choice Hospeco Cellucap Winco Amercare
Aprons, Bib, Disposable, 28X46 10/100 Safety Zone, or approved equal #682APRON #DA-AP2846 #PA2846 #NDAP1252846 #RPA20
Pack 10/100 Pack 10/100 Pack 10/100 Pack 12/100 Pack 5/100
$47.90 BX $54.73 $147.75 $78.86 $53.83
$20.50 54.92 $14.68 $24.00
Choice Clearb Uli Clearb, $31.73
Bags, Clear, w/ Die Cut Handle 100 ct Clearbags, or approved equal #103MB150419W . ne carvags Elkay
Pack 5/100 #CB-H912CL1 #S-5137 #H912CL1 HTO1194
$102.49 100/Pack 100/Pack 100/Pack
$19.49 $9.45 $17.85 $14.17
Duro Victoria Bay §26.13 Victoria Bay Duro
B. Lunch, B #6 500 ct Di d 1
ags, Luneh, Brown ¢ 1o, or approved cqua #433B6BG #VB6SOB ?gg/ecn}l #VB6SOB #18406
500/CT 500/CT 500/CT 500/CT
$85.49 $11.40 $32.25 $10.77
Choice Elkay $35.37 LK Packaging Elkay
Bags, Lunch, Plasti ay Styl 1 Elkay Plastic, or a al ackagi
ags, Lunch, Plastic (Subway Style) 000 ct ay Plastic, or approved equal 41503591 HEP6G063015 LKlgggl/(é;:}mg 7G054024 46G063015
500/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
gfﬂw B$76'67ﬁ $126.16 $95.31 B$67'21‘t
Bags, Lunch, 8 # waxed, 6 x 12 white prefered 1000 ct Bagcraft, or approved equal o1ce agera Uline Victoria Bay agera
#150298 #BGC300298 1000/CT 1000/CT #300298
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$56.49 $23.30 54.69 $38.59
Choice Brown $42.72 Victoria Bay Bagcraft
Bags. Wa . ich. 6"x3/4"x7" 1 B 2 al i
ags, Wax Sandwich, 6"x3/4"x7 000 ct rown, or approved equa #1503003542 4BR-704 lggg;ge-r HSWAX 4300411
2000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$44.84 $68.40 $115.94 $64.59
. . Ziploc Elkay $171.06 Imperial Elkay
Bags, Ziplock, 13X15 (2 gallon) 10/100 ct Elkay Plastic, or approved equal 4721682253 4EPF21315 Boardwalk 4F21315 421315
100/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$22.09 $10.67 $16.80 $10.18
Ziploc Elkay $30.39 LK Packaging Elkay
Bags, Ziplock, 4X 10/1 Elkay Plastic, or a al iversz
ags, Ziplock, 4X6 07100 et ay Plastie, or approved equal #721682255 HEPF20406 lljg(')‘('f/g;l #F20406 #F20604
500/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$34.99 $22.08 $91.28 $34.72 $5.93
. . Supply Source/Saftey Zone, or Choice Supply Surce ) Vanguard Safety Amercare
Beard C traints whit 1000 ct.
card L-over restraints white ¢ approved equal #167WHISNLBN #MBC-1000/W .%‘53782 #B12A19 4RBPIM
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 100/CT




PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES
INVITATION TO BID 24-017
BID SUMMARY

The recommendation of award is based on the vendor with the majority of low bid prices. Calculation does not include the items highlighted in blue where a bid price was not submitted.

Devi Enterprises LLC /
11400 Inc. hy P
Description Unit Description Brand Lol Cop_aco b Head to Heels Safety Nottage LLC St ey
Imperial Dade . Group
Supplies
$9.36
SéSS.lét g212.30 $25.91 $28.30 Waxie/KIK
Bleach 3/120 fl oz Clorox, or approved equal ome orox Clorox i #170018
#63202291 #E-CLO30966 3/1200Z 3/1GAL
3/1GAL 3/1200Z
$2.32
$1.40 .
$7.14 Janico $1.15
Better Brush $3.36
. . . Lavex #BOTTLE32(bottle) Impact
Bottle 32 0z. w/ a stabl. Bottl T B Brush 2 al
ottle 32 oz. w/ adjustable trigger ottle & Trigger ctter Brush, or approved equal #27423KIT :BBBB]l:55553)671302 ((ttrJiottl:r)) Bo?rdExalk Impact Products #5032WG/5902DZ-951
3Pack &5 #5906B(trigger) 1EA
1 EA
1EA
o7 o o o
Bowl, R Black 24 "x1-1/2" 4/1 Pak, P k. 1 isions .
owl, Round, Black 24 oz, 9"x1-1/ /100 Gen Pak, Parpak, or approved equa #130RCB024BLK #WNA-82638 Y(;B'/‘g; Gejoy #4548425/CP8524
100/CT 250/CT 300/CS
0 w o 0
Bowl, fi 5 Black 8/125 Gen Pak, Dart d 1
owl, foam > oz Blac en Fak Lart, or approved equa #3015BWBQ #DART-SBWBQ IO%;;ET HLAMOS3L YTKB00040000
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 8/125 CT
$48.02 $20.74 $45.34
Parpak R Victoria Bay WNA/Atrium
Bowl, Plastic, 12 oz (For both h 1d foods s per case) | Parpak, or a al i
owl, Plastic, 12 oz (For both hot & cold foods) 500 (pcs per case) arpak, or approved equal No Bid HFWNA-24013 B(S)(a)gig;lk HVBBI12PPW #4013
500/CT 500/CT 500/CT
§54'2&i $444.04 $91.96 WNT/IAﬁ
Bowl, Plastic, 16 oz (For both hot & cold foods) 500 (pes per case)  |Parpak, or approved equal No Bid arp Fineline Jolly Chef um
#WNA-24017 500/CT 900/CT 24017
500/CT 500/CT
parp ss280 36420 WNA A
Bowl. Black Squz lasti S as Parpak. or 2 al g
owl, Black Square 8 oz, plastic 500 (pes per case) arpak, or approved equal No Bid HWNA-SBBOOBK Dart Dart SBBOOSBK
500/CT e gRest 500/CT
500/CT
$49.39 $24.07 $4731 $35.06 $33.63
Bowl, Squat, 12 oz 20/25 Convermex, or approved equal Dart Oz Dart Dart DART
- >duat » Or app q #301125120 H#CONV-12FC20 S00/CT so0eT 125120
500/CT 500/CT 500/CT
$67.59 $40.94 $63.63 $48.64 $54.72
Bowl, Squat, 8 oz 40/25 Convermex, or approved equal Dart e Dart Dart DART
s>l » 0T 4PP q #30188J12 CONV-8FC20 L000/CT L000/CT #8820
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$10.00 $6.90 $20.18 $12.73 $6.91
Carlise ABCO L Janico Network (Odell)
B Yucca, 42" Handl ach B Brush 2 al Sa
room, Corn, Yucca, andle eacl etter Brush, or approved equal 12714134967 #ABCO-00304NB U:}l;[:n 440468 400712
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA
$16.89 $3.32 $36.47 $6.75 $4.51
. " Lavex ABCO Rubbermaid ABCO Network (Odell)
Broom, Large Angle w. Black Poly bristles 48", black metal handle each ABCO, or approved equal #697UBKB12KT SABCO-1024M Commercial 4BR100S4 4F11601M
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA
$34.99 $43.67 $132.41 $42.00 $50.82
. Lavex ABCO Rubbermaid Lavex Impact
Bucket, M 2 ach B Brush 2 al
ucket, Mop w/ Wringer, 26t e tter Brush, or approved equa #274MBCKT26YL #ABCO-T01008 Commercial #274MBCKT26YL #9Y/2626-3Y
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA




The recommendation of award is based on the vendor with the majority of low bid prices. Calculation does not include the items highlighted in blue where a bid price was not submitted.

PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES

INVITATION TO BID 24-017
BID SUMMARY

Devi Enterprises LLC /
11400 Inc. hy P
Description Unit Description Brand Lol Cop_aco b Head to Heels Safety Nottage LLC St ey
Imperial Dade . Group
Supplies
$29.89 $16.35 $124.39 $24.66 $11.22
. LK Packaging Elkay ) LK Packaging Heritage Bag
Bun Rack Ci 52X80 4/50 Elkay Plast d 1
un Rack Covers, ay Plastic, or approved equal 4409RCS0 4EPBOR5280 Integt)ag;c(};cup 4BOR5280HD 470430XN RO
50/CT 50/CT 50/CT 50/CT
$25.99 $14.68 $44.98 $17.96
. . Republic/Victoria Bay, or approved Lavex Republic bag § Heritage Bag
an | 1 mil 40x46 black 45 gal 1 2 2 26.

(Can liner | mil 40x46 black 45 ga 00 equal #5014046M1 #BKA48BK Bcl’g:%;lk $26.83 #X8046PKIR01
100/CT 100/CT 100/CT
$25.99 $22.30 $56.50 $28.03 $22.51

Lo . Advantage Chemicals Hi-Valu i Victoria bay WAXIE/Midlab

Cl All P Liquid, P 4/1 gal Hi-Value, 409 d 1

canser, AT Frpose, Liquic, Tine & 1-yatue, 557,01 approvec equa #146PINECLN #R3-73000033 . /IféSZL #C00160 HWX4124
4/1GAL 4/1GAL 4/1GAL 4/1GAL
$/3XJ5'£(8 S Professiii\laiglfroducts
leanser, All Purpose, P 2421 Ajax, or a al i j !
Cleanser, urpose, Powder /21 oz Comet/Ajax, or approved equa No Bid HE-CPC14278 24»;?3;/61“ $28.52 HCPC214278CT
24-210Z/CT 24-210Z/CT
$34.44 $16.35 $114.53 $45.86 $15.43
. LK Packaging Elkay L LK Packaging Elkay
Clear Food St Bag, L. 27x37-BunPan Ci 200 Elkay Plast d 1
Car F00C Storage Bag, Large, £/xo/-Suntan Lover 2y Fastic, of approvec equal #182C35 #EPBOR2737HD T;&%E’;ls #BOR2737HD #BOR2737HD
200/CT 200/CT 200/CT 200/CT
$29.89 $12.60 $31.30 $62.83 $15.43
LK Packaging Republic Bag X SLI Medical Elkay
l a F A B. 2 ag
(Clear Food Storage Bag, 52 x 80 #409RC80 #N528015BP ["wpsl‘(‘;tcg“’“p #101872536 #BOR5280
50/CT 50/CT 50/CT 50/CT
$33.00 $51.77 $31.17
Elkay SO LK Packaging Elkay
Clear Food St Bag, Small 12X8X30 500 Elkay Plasti d 1 No Bid i
ear Food Storage Bag, Smal ay Plastic, or approved equal o Bi HEPSG128030 LKSPanc/kCa?ng #8G128030 #8G128030
500/CT 500/CT 500/CT
$25.99 $25.50 $38.53 $28.57 $24.09
. . . ChoiceHD Dart § Darnel Deli DART
2 Deli Clea Attached L 2/1 Da 2 al 2

Container, 8 0z, Deli Clear w/ Attached Lid /100 art, or approved equal #128HDSCOMBO 4DART-CHSDEF 2(]))0ng 4D750800 4CHSDEF
240/CT 200/CT 200/CT 200/CT
$19.49 $17.88 $38.53 $19.56

. Choice Victoria Bay y $26.70 AMHIL
Cup, 2 oz Portion, Black, Round 2500 On the go, or approved equal 4127P2B 4VBPC2B Bzcsa(;(c)lrgll.k ASB200BPP
2500/CT 2500/CT 2500/CT
$58.49 $40.04 $59.23 $42.93
Dart Covermex $62.97 Dart DART
s, 12 Foam (F ffe 1 E al 2

Cups, 12 oz, Foam (For Coffee) 000 Convermex, or approved equal 430112112 4CONV-12B16 lolgg;(l:T 412916 412112
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$47.99 $77.42 $62.38 $73.11
Choice Fabri-Kal $145.58 Victoria Bay Fabrikal

C 12/14 oz Squat 1000 Fabri-Kal. d 1 ) -]

Ups, TATL4 0z Squa (pes per case) | Fabri-Kal, or approved equa #500CC12 #FAB9502053 FI?)%'(‘) /Iéil #VBCCSPETI2 9502120
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$85.79 $26.78 $70.26 $62.00
Dart Covermex $34.31 Dart DART
5, 1 foam (Drink 2072 : al :

Cups, 16 oz, Styrofoam (Drink Cup) 0/25 Convermex, or approved equal 430116116 4CONV-16B16 lolgg;(l:T 416116 416116
1000/CT 500/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$44.49 $29.06 $80.20 $59.93 $36.78

. . Choice Victoria Bay § Victoria Bay AMHIL

C Plastic Portion 5.5 oz, Cl 2500 On The Go, d 1

ups, Hastic Yortion 2. oz, Llear T 218 150, of approvec equa #127P550C #VBPC55C 5 5%8;1CT #VBCP55C #ASB550PP
2500/CT 2500/CT 2500/CT 2500/CT




PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES

INVITATION TO BID 24-017
BID SUMMARY

The recommendation of award is based on the vendor with the majority of low bid prices. Calculation does not include the items highlighted in blue where a bid price was not submitted.

Devi Enterprises LLC /
11400 Inc. hy P
Description Unit Description Brand Lol Cop_aco b Head to Heels Safety Nottage LLC St ey
Imperial Dade . Group
Supplies
$41.59 $31.22 $34.96 $30.24
Dart Covermex $39.14 Dart DART
C 8 Styrofc Drink C 40/25 C d 1
ups, 8 oz, Styrofoam (Drink Cup) onvermex, or approved equa 4301818 4CONV-SBS Iogg?CT 4878 4878
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$42.99 $57.05 $132.65 $132.06 $37.40
. . Choice Fabri-Kal iy Victoria Bay AMHIL
5,9 oz, Clear (F hies 1 Fabri-Kal, or 2 al abri-Kz
Cups, 9 oz, Clear (For Smoothies) 000 abri-Kal, or approved equal #500CC9 4FAB9502040 ];B%r(‘)/'é:}l 4PTC09D92 4ACRO
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$47.99 $77.42 $87.40 $138.16 $43.07
. . Choice Fabri-Kal ’ Victoria Bay AMHIL
C Clq 12 oz., For S th: 1000 Fabri-Kal. d 1
ups, Llear, 2 oz., For Smootiies abri-Ral, or approved equa #500CC12 H#FAB9502120 Iﬁgg;&; #VG12CF #ACR12
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$49.49 $54.66 $67.57 $177.36 $44.49
Choice On The Go B 'rti alk Choice AMHIL
#500CC16 #M-CUP-PET-16 106’007(’; Different spec/w lid #APC16
Cup, plastic clear 160z. 1000 PET, or approved equal 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
Loves ABCO s29.5 51376 Netwonk (Ode
Deck Brush, Scrub, w/ Plastic Fill ingl Better Brush d 1 i i
eck Brush, Scrub, w/ Plastic Fi single etter Brush, or approved equal #697BLB10SQ #ABCO-00011 Rubbermal(:EACommercml #CITES£04 #DSBCP10
1EA 1EA 1EA
$6.49-160Z $3.08 $8.14 $4.32 $5.27
. Lavex ABCO . ABCO Network (Odell)
Deck M 1 h handle, 14 ach stal Lak F al 2 2
eck Mop #16 with handle, 14 oz eacl Crystal Lake, or approved equal #271165CUTKIT #ABCO-CD-50016 Boiréixalk 4CD50016 45716
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA
$49.99 $26.54 $65.96 $33.60 $43.10
. Noble Chemical Hi Valu . Victoria Bay WAXIE
D H Dut; 4/1 gal Hi-Val d 1
egreaser Heavy Uity & 1-Yal, orapprovec equa #147HDDEGRS1G #R3-73000032 B:/alrgxale #D00998 HWX4102
4/1GAL 4/1GAL 4/1GAL 4/1GAL
$]63222 $186.15 $113.68 \314)3(;:
Deodori 1l Mi : 12/1 EES, or ¢ al No Bi i
codorizer, Jell Mixture Concentrate /1 qt S, or approved equal o Bid H4EES-FG9958QT 4/]f§iL Rlezn/zl;llt 4SEP32WSCM
12QT/CT 6/320Z
?5';2( $166.01 $15.58 WNgZ/k?t’j
Tray, 5 oz. Clear Square Dish 15MIL 2500 Parpak, or approved equal No Bid arp ParPak Qeirudu um
#WNA-29829 4/1GAL SO/CT #29828
2500/CT 2500/CT
$48.70 $77.85 $60.00 $43.49
L . . . . R . Sani Wipe PDI -PROFFESSIONAL Professional Dispo Professional Dispo
Disinft s, Antiba al 2 2 2 al No B
isinfecting Wipes, Antibacterial 6/200ct Sani Wipe, or approved equal o Bid 4ENICP22884 DISPOSABLE 4p22834 4p22834
6/200CT 4/1GAL 6/200CT 6/200CT
$25.00
$41.59 Kimberly Clark $94.88 $12.60 $28.33
. . . . . . Dixie Ultra #KIM09023-10 Scott Cascades Pro Kimberly Clark
Dis ser, Napkin (Mega Ce S Dis ser, Napk K ly Clark, or al
ispenser, Napkin (Mega Cartridge System) ispenser, Napkin imberly Clark, or approved equal 4712545504 $66.00 875/PK-6PK/CT 4C402 409023
1EA #KIMO09135 NAPKINS 1EA 1EA
1EA
$L3a6vsf $32.18 %i,fyl sﬁ?ﬂ
Dis Paper Towel Dis Towel  |Tork 1 1
ispenser, Paper Towel ispenser, Towe! ork, or approved equal H66ALPTLEVRBLK $0.00 T](;i( 4553008 A 434TR
1EA 1EA 1EA
$11.69 $48.75 $3.16 gg_:)cl)
Dispenser, soap ez-foam Kutol, or approved equal Kutol $0.00 GOJO Performance Plus #4131-06
#5259942BLK 1EA #PP890OF -

6/CT




The recommendation of award is based on the vendor with the majority of low bid prices. Calculation does not include the items highlighted in blue where a bid price was not submitted.

PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES

INVITATION TO BID 24-017
BID SUMMARY

Devi Enterprises LLC /
11400 Inc. hy P
Description Unit Description Brand Lol Cop_aco b Head to Heels Safety Nottage LLC St ey
Imperial Dade . Group
Supplies
$25.99 $25.94 $49.43 $32.41 $30.48
. . Lavex Better Brush | . Performance Plus Impact
Dolly (for 20-55 gallon containers) each Better Brush, or approved equal 4274TCDOLLY 4BBP-210305 GlobalI ;ilusmal 4PPBS-DOLLY 47704
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA
$10.39 $7.65 $24.23 $19.56 $10.64
Dust Pan, Long Handle each Better Brush, or approved equal Lavex ASED Im ;ct Rubbermaid Exec Series [mpact
»-ong » Or app q #697LDP12CL #ABCO-DP-00204EH N #2531RM 1EA
1EA 1EA 1EA
$16.24 $10.56 $19.60 $13.22 $9.18
. " Choice Safecut Foodpak o Victoria bay SMART
Film Wrap, 12" Cutter Box 2000 ft roll Foodpak, or approved equal #18212X2SC HFPW122 Boiréixalk H12XOM #7304351/SM12CBF32
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA
$22.09 $16.43 $27.15 $18.00 $12.87
. " Choice Safecut Foodpak . Victoria Bay SMART
Film Wrap, 18 2000 ft roll Foodpak, or approved equal 418218X2SC SFPW182 Bcalréll\:/alk 18X2M 7304352/SM18CBF32
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA
$43.99 $43.23 $74.58 $55.53
Carnival King Brown $128.99 Novolex Bagcraft Bagcraft
Foil Bag, Ha andwich 1 B : al agera
oil Bag, Hamburger/Sandwicl 000 ct rown, or approved equal 41504381M 4BR-5A04 ?gogg/réf; 4300533 4300533
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$44.99 $45.10 $93.71 $62.33
Carnival King Brown $112.37 Novelex Bagcraft Bagcraft
Foil Bag, Hotd 1000 ct B: d 1
oft bag, Hotdog ¢ TOWn, O approvec equa #1504561M #BR-5A12 ?gogg/'éﬁ #300455 #300456
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$20.39 $24.17 $27.72 $28.02 $19.21
. AmerCare/Wellchoice, or approved Visions AmerCare/Wellchoice N Victoria Bay Banya
Forks Black Wre Heavy D apk 1 2 2
orks Black Wrapped Heavy Duty no napkin 000t equal #130HFBK 1M #M-CTLY5308F Bfggg;‘gik #IPP2FB #600105
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$9.09 $6.08 $7.04 $5.19
Lavex Safety Zone $35.41 Safety Zone Amercare
Gloves, Cleaning, Flocklined 12/ea Safety-zone, or approved equal #394YWLTXI5L 4GRFYLIB I;\;;;:gs 4GRFYLG2EM 4590-3
12PR/CS 12PR/CS 1PR 12PR/CS
$25.99 $19.88 $25.94 $18.49
Noble Products Safety Zone $44.29 Victoria Bay Amercare
loves, Vinyl, L 10/100cs afety Z : al
(Gloves, Vinyl, 0/100cs Safety Zone, or approved equa #394365LCASE #GVP9-LG-HH | ol\ls[:((i%)lg/vcs #64V3000PFL #2299-3
10BX100/CS 10BX100/CS 10BX100/CS 10BX100/CS
$25.99 $19.88 $25.94 $18.49
Noble Products Safety Zone $44.29 Victoria Bay Amercare
Gloves, Vinyl, M 10/100cs Safety Zone, or approved equal 4394365MCASE 4GVP9-MD-HH 101;4;;((1%181/\;:5 464V3000PFM 422092
10BX100/CS 10BX100/CS 10BX100/CS 10BX100/CS
$25.99 $19.88 $25.94 $18.49
Noble Products Safety Zone $44.29 Victoria Bay Amercare
Gloves, Vinyl, XL 10/100cs Safety Zone, or approved equal 4394365XLCASE 4GVPO-XL-HH 101]\3/[;:((:%1(1)1/VCS 464V3000PFXL 42004
10BX100/CS 10BX100/CS 10BX100/CS 10BX100/CS
Srong 514700 iy Amerese
loves, Vinyl, XXL 10/100cs afety Z : al i
Gloves, Vinyl, 0/100cs Safety Zone, or approved equa No Bid 4STRONG-73016 10}(’)[/1;X 464V3000PFXL 422095
10BX90/CS 10BX100/CS 10BX100/CS
$5.19 $2.15 $7.94 $8.76 $2.29
. . Cordova MCR Safety . Impact Products D&IJ Imports
Goggles, Ch 1 Resistant Safety Zi d 1
oggles, Lhcmical Resistan alely Zone, ot approved equa #444GDS10 #E-CRW2220 MCI}ES:&‘Y #7320GOOGLE #1009
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA




The recommendation of award is based on the vendor with the majority of low bid prices. Calculation does not include the items highlighted in blue where a bid price was not submitted.

PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES

INVITATION TO BID 24-017
BID SUMMARY

Devi Enterprises LLC /
11400 Inc. hy P
Description Unit Description Brand Lol Cop_aco b Head to Heels Safety Nottage LLC St ey
Imperial Dade . Group
Supplies
$45.99 $27.82 $20.80 $4.97
Choice Supply Source $30.80 The Hairnet Co Safeco Amercare
Hair Bonnets (Large - 21") 500/pack Safety Zone, or approved equal #167BK2 INLHN 4MB-21-1000/W I\;[g(()l/gch_lrv SHC-HNL-BK 4RP11ONWP
1000/CT 1000/CT 144/CT 100/CT
$35.99 $24.63 $48.72 $20.16 $26.01
. " Choice Supply Source N The Hairnet Co Safeco Saf-T-Gard
Hair B S all - 1 ack afety Z F al
air Bonnets (Sma 9" 500/pac Safety Zone, or approved equal #167BK1SNLEN #MB-19-1000/W lg(])‘/lg[ #HC-HNL-BK. H18W
1000CT 1000/CT 144/CT 1000/CT
$85.09 $64.61 $61.62 $70.76 $37.46
L. . Kutol Purell Purell GOJO GOJO
Hand Sanit Fi for D 2/12L Purell d 1
and sanitizer, toam, tor Lispenset et or approved equa #52568241 #G0JO5392-02 2/CT #6574-02 5053-02
6/1000ML 2/1.2L 2/1200ML 2/1200ML
$74.75 $54.71 $139.74 $51.67
L. B Kutol Purell Uline GOJO
Ha 2 P Bottles 4/21 S Purell 3 al 94.
and Sanitizer, Pump Bottles /2 liter pumps urell, or approved equal 1452565636 HGOIO5015-04 1EA $94.75 #5015-04
8/1L 4/1.5L 4/1.5L
$6.49 $2.90 $13.51 $12.00 $3.32
Lavex ABCO N ABCO Network (Odell)
Handle, Deck Scrub Brush h Better Brush d equal
andle, Deck Serub Brus cac etter Brush, or approvec equa #697TMFG60BK #ABCO-00011 B""‘lr]‘;‘:’alk #01102 #00675
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA
$7.16 $11.87 $12.00 $7.14
. 5 ABCO y ABCO Network (Odell)
Handle, M addle T ach B Brush 2 al
andle, Mop (Wingnut Wooden Saddle Type) eacl etter Brush, or approved equal No Bid #ABCO-01203NB Boalréi‘:/alk £01102 £C-960
1EA 1EA 1EA
$3.24 $4.76 $18.34 $3.90 $5.24
Handle, tapered for floor squeegee Better Brush, or approved equal e ABCO Genuil;e Joe ABCO Rubbermaid
- 1ap quec » O app q #697TAPEREDG0 #ABCO-TO8114 N 401113 #FG636200NAT
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA
$7‘§3 $.22’10 $29.08 $22.80 a6
. . Choice Vintage L Ocala
Lid for Steamtable Pan, 1/2 size case (100 pc) Durable, or approved equal Boardwalk Victoria Bay
#4070120 #V35085 100/CT SVBLHF #SMAHSPL
1EA 100/CT 100/CT
$14.29 $27.70 $26.70 $17.34
Choice Vintage $33.11 Victoria Bay Ocala
Lid for Steamtable Pan, full 50 Durabl d 1
id for Steamtable Pan, case (50 pc) urable, or approved equal 44070110 4V35086 Bcsaéficw_?lk SVBFSL 4SMAFSPL
1EA 50/CT 50/CT 50/CT
$17.54 $56.02 $46.00 $58.68
Visions Parpak $36.26 Wood Centric Anchor
Lid, 8-7/8", for 24 Bowl 4 Pak, Parpak, or : al
id, 8-7/8", for 24 oz round Bow /50 Gen Pak, Parpak, or approved equa #130RCBO32FL #WNA-82639 ;)%jé‘} 150/CT #4308427/CP8524
100/CT 250/CT 300/CT
e o
Lids for 12/14 oz Squat C 1000 Fabri-Kal. d 1 ) 42.00
ids for oz Squat Cups (pes per case) |Fabri-Kal, or approved equal #S00LFLAT 4FAB9508079 Blcoa(;(c)lrgllnk $ #9508079
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$69.54 $39.56 $32.65 $28.60
Dart Covermex $67.09 Victoria Bay DART
Lids, 12 0z, Sip, for Foam Cofft 1 : al :
ids, 12 oz, Sip, for Foam Coffee Cup 000 Convermex, or approved equal #30112EL 4CONV-L16G lolgg;(l:T 4FOIHCF H12FTLS
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$17.49 $14.23 $54.42 $26.70 $17.00
. . Fabri-Kal, On The Go, or approved Choice Victoria Bay . Victoria Bay Amhil
Lids, 2 0z Round Portion Cup 2500 equal #127PL2 #VBPCLT2 F;ls’(';('fi‘l #VBPCP2B #ASL2
2500/CT 2500/CT ¢ 2500/CT 2500/CT




PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES
INVITATION TO BID 24-017
BID SUMMARY

The recommendation of award is based on the vendor with the majority of low bid prices. Calculation does not include the items highlighted in blue where a bid price was not submitted.

Devi Enterprises LLC /
11400 Inc. hy P
Description Unit Description Brand Lol Cop_aco b Head to Heels Safety Nottage LLC St ey
Imperial Dade . Group
Supplies
i:;:ﬁ S WNﬂf/iigum
Lids, Cl S For 8-16 oz Contai 500 P k. d 1 No Bid No Bid Not h infc
ids, Clear, Square, For oz Containers arpak, or approved equal o Bi #WNA-SBB200FL S(I)Z(t)z;lgT o Bid Not enough info 482639
500/CT 250/ct
$27.99 $19.70 $50.44 $26.67
Choice Covermex $38.88 EcoChoice Ambhil
Lids, Straw Slot, 1 Drink Cups 10/1 : al :
ids, Straw Slot, 16 oz Styro Drink Cups 0/100 Convermex, or approved equal 4S00LFLAT 4CONV-L16ST lolgg;(l:T #760PFLIDPLA #16SL
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$26.49 $21.20 $80.44 $24.25 $22.67
. Fabri-Kal, On The Go, or approved Choice Victoria Bay N Victoria Bay Amhil
Lids, for 5.5 1 S19B2 2500 -
ids, for 5.50z clear cup ( ) equal #127PL400 #VBPCLT4 2:%’5 /Iéil #VBPCLT4 #ASL4/S
2500/CT 2500/CT 2500/CT 2500/CT
o =1 e o
Lids, for Sque 12 0z Bowls 10/1 : al :
ids, for Squat 8 & 12 oz Bowls 0/100 Convermex, or approved equal #30120]L 4CONV-LVFC20 lolgg;(l:T #20]L #20]L
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$27.99 $24.04 $31.70 $32.86
Choice Fabri-Kal $136.04 Victoria Bay Ambhil
Lids, w/ Sts Slot, 9 & 12 rti thi 1000 Fabri-Kal. d 1 - -]
ids, w/ Straw Slot, oz portions (smoothies) abri-Kal, or approved equa #SO0LFLAT 4FABO508076 ﬁ?)%ré/léi'l 4FOSHCF 4AG26P
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$34.99 $33.64 $25.56 $42.54
Choice Fabri-Kal §79.21 Victoria Bay Amhil
Lids, Dome for Clez 12 0z, F hies Fabri-Kal, or 3 al - abri-K
ids, Dome for Clear Cup, 12 oz., For Smoothies abri-Kal, or approved equal 4500LDOME 4FAB9508060 ];B%r(;/]é;l #VBDLH92 4ADL626
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$27.99 $38.26 §53.34 $33.72 $26.67
Choice On The Go Daﬁ Dart Ambhil
#500LFLAT #M-CUP-PETLID 1000/CT #16SL #16SL
Lid, plastic for 16 oz. cup 1000 PET, or approved equal 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$3.24 $3.65 $6.31 $3.92 $2.48
Choice ABCO . ABCO Network (Odell)
Mop, Head 24 . Better Brush, or a al ardwa
op, Head 240z ca etter Brush, or approved equa #271241CUTC #ABCO-CM2024 BO"B‘;X“‘"( #CM2024SB #5324-18
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA
$93.59 $63.54 $87.95 $52.00 $56.83
. . Dixie Ultra Kimberly Clark X Empress Elite Kimberly Clark
Napkins, X] M 6/875 Kimberly Clark, d 1
apiins, Apress, Mega tberly ark, of approvec equa #96632019 #KIM98908 SZS;(%T H#ELQS60001 1 #98908
6000/CT 5250/CT 6000/ct 5250/CT
$44.99 $24.69 $61.22 $25.02
. Noble Chemical Harvard § $37.00 WAXIE/Midlab
Neutral Clea 4/1 gal Hi-Val E al 2
cutral Cleaner /1 gal i-Valu, or approved equa #149QPNEUTRAL HHC-242904 The:/clhér‘:fab, HFWX3221
90CT/2TUB 4/1GAL 4/1GAL
$55.49 $56.25 §74.42 $56.06 $19.38
Noble Chemical Easy Off iy Reckitt Benckiser WAXIE/PLZ
Oven Cleaner, Easy Off, Foam Aerosol 12/14.50z Easy Off, or approved equal #14SNUKLEEN HE-RACS7979CT Ela;}//-cc_)rﬁ 4EASYOFF24 41031531
12/180Z 12/140Z 6/240Z 6/200Z
$43.99 $47.10 $55.28 $42.56
Bakers Mark Durabl $855.96 Victoria Bay Bagcraft
Pan Liners, 16 x 24 10/1 Durable, or ¢ al agera
an Liners, 16 x 0/1000 urable, or approved equal #433QLINER 4DURQPL25 ?gogg/réf; #VBF25Q 4477390
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$13.19 $35.13 $33.90 $25.29
Choice Vintage $20.68 Victoria Bay Ocala
P Steamtable, 1/2 size d 50 Durabl d 1
ans, Steamtable, 1/2 size deep case (50 pc) urable, or approved equal 44070269 4V35080 BOSaéfig-?lk #VBHDSPLT 4SMASPHD
1EA 50/CT 100/CT 100/CT




PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES
INVITATION TO BID 24-017
BID SUMMARY

The recommendation of award is based on the vendor with the majority of low bid prices. Calculation does not include the items highlighted in blue where a bid price was not submitted.

Devi Enterprises LLC /
Description Unit Description Brand HLIDIIe: Cop-aco b Head to Heels Safety Nottage LLC St ey
Imperial Dade . Group
Supplies
$21.59 $47.12 $48.60 $37.13
Choi Vint: $60.66 Victoria B Ocal:
Pans, Steamtable, Full deep case (50 pieces) Durable, or approved equal 44 070582 9 #vl;lsaog;} Bcsa(;flcw_?lk #\;(I;]?gaSPEEI]' 4 SM;aSIiFD
1EA 50/CT 50/CT 50/CT
$32.49 $44.76 $34.18 $28.10
Lavex Tork $37.79 Empress Elite Scatork
Paper Towels 1l 1l ez A, or 3 al ssiona
aper Towels, brown ro 6/roll (ea) SCA, or approved equal #5001 RTSELNAT HBAY31300 Essity l;;gf;_»wnal HELCP660013 #RKSOOE
6/CT 6/CT 6/CT 6/CT
$26.47 $56.14 $33.15 $22.51
. . . . . Hi-Valu i Victoria Bay WAXIE/Midlab
Pine Oil Cl Pine Sol 4/gal Hi-Val d 1 No Bid
ine Oil Cleaner, Pine So gal i-Valu, or approved equal o Bi 4R3-73000041 4/Il(ésZL 4D01030 HWXA124
4/1GAL 4/1GAL 4/1GAL
e e e
Plate, Foam 6" 1 Pak, Darnell, or 2 al :
ate, Foam 6 000 Gen Pak, Damell, or approved equa #3016PWCR #DART-6PWCR . O]SSZZT HEPWC H#GPWCR
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
Kimiggfglark DILIE Kimlf:j;)g lark
No Bid i - *Included with item 47
o Bi HKIMO09135-20 K1mhig)‘;C1ark ncluded with item #09135
Pole stand for napkin dispenser Kimberly Clark, or approved equal 1EA 1EA
$25.00 $23.00
. 89.4108 .
No Bid Kimberly Clark Scott *Included with item 47 LS (Cii <
#KIM09023-10 875PK/4PK/CT #09908
Napkin, Bracket Kimberly Clark, or approved equal 1EA 1EA
$61.09 $53.57 $42.46 $71.84 $39,§7
Sandwich Container w/ hinge lid, clear (hot & cold food) - 6" 500 Durable, or approved equal Dart Dart Pactiv Evergreen Dart RSy
’ ’ #301C53PST1 #DART-C57PSTI 500/CT #C57PST1 #YCI821600000
500/CT 500/CT 500/CT 500/CT
$3.63 $3.96 $6.00 $16.21
Lavex Royal $41.34 Victoria Bay Amercare/Royal
ing Pad, Heavy D 1 Royal, or ¢ al ier Pads
Scouring Pad, Heavy Duty 6/10 ct oyal, or approved equal #483HVYGSCOUR 4RP-S860 PreTsl/e;II(’ads #VBOGMSP #3960
10/PK 10/PK 20/PK 6/10CT
$5.45 $4.80 $45.38 $2.09
Choice Royal $75.14 Skilcft Amercare/Royal
Scrubber, Stainless Steel 6/12 ct Royal. d 1 i
Crubber, Stainiess Stee ¢ oval or approved equa #483SS50SCRUB #8730/6 P re‘;lzlfgads #NSN9265176 #8730
12PK 12/PK 12/PK 12/PK
$62.92 $40.13 $82.46 $48.48 $51.77
Kutol Kutol X Performance Plus GOJO/Purell
ap, Hand foz 1 1 . Kutol : al
Soap, Hand foam 6/1000 ml (33.8 0z) [Kutol, or approved equal 452563141 469041 I;/lg?r] 4PPTR00F 44171-08
6/1000ML 6/1000ML 6/1000ML 8/1000ML
$46.79 $28.20 $58.67 $65.27 $30.71
Scrubble by ACS Royal . The Clorox Co Amercare/Royal
S Pad 12/10 ct Royal. d 1
0ap Fads ¢ Oya’, or approved equa #561327250 #RP-S1012 I‘;(';lé"T H#CLOX88320 #S1012
120/CT 120/CT 180/CT 120/CT
$28.59 $24.17 $31.70 $28.00 $19.21
. AmerCare/Wellchoice, or approved Visions AmerCareWellchoice N Victoria Bay Banyan
s, Black Wre Heavy Duty- apk 1 3 .
Spoons, Black Wrapped Heavy Duty- no napkin 000t equal #130HBKCUTTW #M-CTLY5308S Bfggg;‘gik #IPP2TSB #600107
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$5.06 I:SiZS.SOd $121.34 Vi $t30‘49; Gofél/i)so 1
Spray-N-Go RTU Sanitizer 12/1 qt Harvard, or approved equal Noble Chemical arvar Diversey ictoria Bay ure
13202 #HC-31502 12/3207 #C00187 #3341-06
12/320Z 12/320Z 6/320Z




The recommendation of award is based on the vendor with the majority of low bid prices. Calculation does not include the items highlighted in blue where a bid price was not submitted.

PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES

INVITATION TO BID 24-017
BID SUMMARY

Devi Enterprises LLC /
11400 Inc. hy P
Description Unit Description Brand Lol Cop_aco b Head to Heels Safety Nottage LLC St ey
Imperial Dade . Group
Supplies
$3.65 $29.14 $13.20 $7.05
each Better Brush, or approved equal No Bid AT Un'er Reltpermeld puoteunaid
» O app q #ABCO-T061 14NR T #RCPIC27BLA #FG9C2700BLA
Floor Squeegee 22" Moss Foam Rubber twin rubber blade 1EA 1EA 1EA
$54.49 $30.40 $107.18 $55.84 $83.04
. . . Noble Chemical Chase Spary Pak P SprayPak Essendant
ainless 1 clez 12/1 as heila Sh F al 2
Stainless Steel cleaner 12/100z case Sheila Shine, or approved equal #148EXCEL HCHA-4334111 ST;Z]/‘TO%SC #4334111x #SSIICT
12/180Z 12/100Z 12/180Z 12/100Z
Craie Primesarcs sa0s1 34260 Banyn
St Reg Drinking, 5-7/8" Milk Sts Clear Wi d Cardinal d 1 i i
raws, Reg Drinking, ilk Straws, Clear Wrappe case ardinal, or approved equa H4SSWITIN 4R3-76009757 IZCOII)(E;:CeT E;;(()jol}glf;'e 4600218SM
12000/CT 12000/CT 12000/CT
Chace Cari 518135 53931 Daw
aws, XLa : -3/4" Black hi 1 ardinal, or 2 al i i
Straws, XLarge, Unwrapped, 5-3/: lack, Smoothie 50/150 Cardinal, or approved equal 448SWBTBKW HCAR-510744 7(5388;22 E:;gjol}(ojl;e HTMSU50-250T
4500/CT 7500/CT 12500/CT
$20.39 $26.51 $0.41 $21.55 $24.06
. . Choice Tork $12.30 Victoria Bay Tork
T, Facial, 2 P 30/b Atlas, Tork. d 1
fssue, Facial, < FY ox as, ToTi o approved equa #5002FC100 #TF6710A Boardwalk #VBFACIAL 4TF6710A
30/CT 30/CT 30/CT 30/CT 30/CT
$1.91
Ifjei /fgcgg $9.43 Rubbermaid Rubﬂjﬁaid
Toilet Brush ach Better Brush, or ¢ al
oilet Brus| eacl etter Brush, or approved equal 4697TBB14CDDY #ABCO-00017 Boalr;aixalk #631 L:TM #FG631000WHT
1EA 1EA 1EA
$94.24 $52.93 $79.56 $52.99
Tork Tork $77.19 Essity Tork
Toilet Tiss i Tork 1
otlet Tissue 36/ea (roll ork, or approved equa #5002TP110292A #BAY61990 ESZ'ZCTTO Tk #472880 #110292A
36/CT 36/CT 36/CT 36/CT
$24.69 $24.35 §55.48 $43.07 $28.86
Trash Can - 32 gallon each Impact, or approved equal Lavex IS Ul{ne Rubbermaid Brute [mpact
& pact or app q #475TCRND32GY #ABCO-BS32G . #OC2632GRAY #7732-3
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA
$45.49 $66.24 $105.86 $62.56
Lavex Supply Source $146.99 Rubbermaid Brute Impact
Trash Can - 55 gall ach Impa : al ai ia
rash Can - 55 gallon eacl mpact, or approved equal #475TCRNDS5GY 477553 Rubbermdllciz([iommercml #2655GRAY #7755-3
1EA 1EA 1EA 2/CT
$25.99 $25.95 $47.05 $30.48
Lavex Better Brush §44.82 Rubbermaid Brute Impact
Trash Can Dolly (20-55 gal capacity) each Impact, or approved equal 4274TCDOLLY 4BBP-210305 Bcalréll\:/alk HFG264000BLA 47704
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA
$10.39 $5.81 $21.90 $18.80 $8.40
. Lavex ABCO | . Rubbermaid Impact
Trash Can Lid - 32 gall ach Impa : al : stries
rash Can Lid - 32 gallon eacl mpact, or approved equal #47STCLD32GY #ABCO-32-T Globdlllgiusmes HOC2631GRAY 4GL320203
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA
$16.89 $29.87 $22.80 $28.21
Lavex Supply Source $44.38 Rubbermaid Impact
Trash Can Lid - 55 gall h I t. d 1 i
rash Can Li gallon eac] mpact, or approved equal 4475TCLD55GY 4775623 Globallléliustrles HOC2654GRAY #7756.3
1EA 1EA 1EA 1EA
$26.39 $20.44 $40.79 $38.94 $18.82
. Natural Eco-Kraft Victoria Bay y Victoria Bay Southern Chami on Tray
Trays, #1, Fries 1 Hotpack, or al 2
rays, #1, Fries 000 otpack, or approved equa #795100ECOIM #VBIFTRP Bf&;g;‘(’:a;k #VBFTIRP #0413
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT




PURCHASE OF PAPER PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES
INVITATION TO BID 24-017
BID SUMMARY

The recommendation of award is based on the vendor with the majority of low bid prices. Calculation does not include the items highlighted in blue where a bid price was not submitted.

Devi Enterprises LLC /
11400 Inc. hy P
Description Unit Description Brand Lol Cop_aco b Head to Heels Safety Nottage LLC St ey
Imperial Dade . Group
Supplies
$33.59 $25.31 $51.09 $42.52 $21.96
Natural Eco-Kraft Victoria Bay . Victoria Bay Southern Chami on Tray
Trays, #2, Nacho 1000 Hotpack, or approved equal #795200ECO 1M 4VB2FTRP Blo;égréa—ll-k 4VBFT2RP 40417
1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT 1000/CT
$31.19 $21.72 $25.20 $20.39
Dart Dart $31.20 GenPak Ecopax
T , 3 C t t Hinged, 9"X9"X3 2/100 Dart, GenPak, d 1
rays, o Lompartment Himge art, entak, or approved equa #30190HTPF3 #90HTPF3 5 (i)ng #SN203 #RE993
200/CT 200/CT 200/CT 200/CT
$21.96 $46.69 $52.93 $21.08
Trays, 5 Compartment, Polystyrene foam, black, 8.31" W x 10.25" L x 1.08" 500 Npxone. or approved equal No Bid NPX-One Pactiv E : Pactiv NPXOne
H pxone, orapp q #NPX100920568 et #YTHBO50 H#1E+08
500/CT 500/CT 500/CT
$64.99 $46.63 $67.91 $59.15 $43.63
. Dart Dart § Dart Pactiv
T Clear H d D 8 1/4"X8 1/4"X3 250 Dart, Durabls d 1
rays, et Hinged Deep, art, Durable, or approved equa #301C90PSTI #C90PSTI 25%727 #C90PSTI #YCI821200000
250/CT 250/CT 250/CT 200/CT
e o e B
Trays, Clear Hi hall 1/4"X8 1/4"X2 2 Dart, Durabl 2 al 2
rays, Clear Hinged Shallow, 8 1/4"X8 1/ 50 art, Durable, or approved equa 4301C89PST1 4CR9PSTI 2;30ng 4C89PSTI 4C89PSTI
250/CT 250/CT 250/CT 250/CT
$94.89 $21.72 $75.12 $20.39
Durable Packaging Plasticfar $39.35 Dart Ecopax
T 1C t t Hinged 9x9x3 250 Dart, GenPak, d 1
rays, 1 ompartment Hinged X art, entak, or approved equa #433PXT900 #M-FOAM12084 25%727 4C9SPSTI #RE993S
200/CT 200/CT 200/CT 200/CT
= ey
T-Shirt Mega Thank You Bei s ANS Plastic, or a al i i
Shirt Mega Thank You Beige 700/cs S Plastic, or approved equa 4433NHTI01 4ANS-MEGA-BAG 7[()J(l)1lnCeT no understanding HCT1923TYD
700/CT 700/CT 1000/CT
g:",% D$549b?)1 $12.34 $7.40 D$5i?
(Wax Paper Sheets, 12" x 10-3/4" 500/bx 500/bx Brown, or approved equal o1¢¢ urab'e Bagcraft Victoria bay urable
#433DSI12T #sw-12 500/CT 500/CT #SW-12
6000/CT 500/CT 12/500CT
$24.69 $20.99 $53.63 $25.24 $20.77
. . Advantage Chemicals Hi-Valu ) Victoria Bay WAXIE/Midlab
lea lass 4/1 gal Hi-Valu, or ¢ al ardwa
Window Cleaner, Glass /1 ga i-Valu, or approved equa #146GLASSCLN #R3-73000042 B;/‘lrgﬁ‘lk #F00005 #WX9505
4/1GAL 4/1GAL 4/1GAL 4/1GAL
$38.99 $29.21 $40.22 $40.05 $50.66
. . . WipePlus Lysol y Reckitt Benckiser GOJO/Purell
‘Wipes, Lysol Disinfectant 6/80ct Lemon Lime Blossom 6/80ct Lysol, or approved equal 450033711 HE-RECTTIS2 Gl/ugosglﬂr 4RB-77182 49341-06
6/75CT 6/80CT 6/80CT 6/110CT
11 43 1 2 48
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